AUTHENTICATED
GOVERNMENT

us.
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
LN HLR. 2035

AN ACT

To correct errors in the authorizations of certain
programs administered by the National Highway
Traffic Safety Administration.



106TH CONGRESS
L HLR. 2035

AN ACT

To correct errors in the authorizations of certain programs
administered by the National Highway Traffic Safety
Administration.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwwes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,



coO N o o b~ W N P

2
SECTION 1. AMENDMENTS TO TITLE 49, UNITED STATES

CODE.
(a) MoTOR VEHICLE SAFETY.—Section 30104 of
title 49, United States Code, is amended by striking
“$81,200,000” and inserting “$98,313,500".

(b) MOTOR VEHICLE INFORMATION.—Section 32102
of title 49, United States Code, is amended by striking
“$6,200,000” and inserting “$9,562,500"".

Passed the House of Representatives July 12, 1999.

Attest:

Clerk.

*HR 2035 EH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T13:17:52-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




