AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1B

Union Calendar No. 114
e 1R 2035

[Report No. 106-200]

To correct errors in the authorizations of certain programs administered
by the National Iighway Traffic Administration.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JUNE 8, 1999

Mr. TavzIN introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Commerce
JUNE 25, 1999

Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State of the Union
and ordered to be printed

A BILL

To correct errors in the authorizations of certain programs
administered by the National Iighway Traffic Adminis-
tration.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



coO N o o b~ W N P

2
SECTION 1. AMENDMENTS TO TITLE 49, UNITED STATES

CODE.

(a) MoTOR VEHICLE SAFETY.—Section 30104 of
title 49, United States Code, is amended by striking
“$81,200,000” and inserting “$98,313,500".

Section 32102

(b) MOTOR VEHICLE INFORMATION.
of title 49, United States Code, is amended by striking

“$6,200,000” and inserting “$9,562,500"".

*HR 2035 RH






Union Calendar No. 114

106TH CONGRESS
LS HLR. 2035

[Report No. 106-200]

A BILL

To correct errors in the authorizations of certain
programs administered by the National Highway
Traffic Administration.

JUNE 25, 1999

Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the
State of the Union and ordered to be printed



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T13:48:46-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




