AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
nL HL R, 2839

To amend the Act which established the Saint-Gaudens National Historic
Site, in the State of New Hampshire, by modifying the boundary, and
for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

SEPTEMBER 13, 1999
Mr. Bass introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Resources

A BILL

To amend the Act which established the Saint-Gaudens Na-
tional Historiec Site, in the State of New Hampshire,
by modifying the boundary, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Saint-Gaudens Na-
tional Historie Site Improvement Act”.

SEC. 2. AMENDMENTS.

The Act of August 31, 1964 (78 Stat. 749), which

established Saint-Gaudens National Historie Site, 1is

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N B

amended—



o N oo o b~ W N B

2

(1) in section 3 by striking “not to exceed sixty-
four acres of lands and interests therein” and insert-
ing “215 acres of lands and buildings, or interests
therein’;

(2) in section 6 by striking “$2,677,000” from
the first sentence and inserting “$10,632,000”; and

(3) in section 6 by striking “$80,000” from the
last sentence and inserting “$2,000,000”.

O

*HR 2839 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T13:25:16-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




