AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
598 HL R, 4420

To reauthorize the Southwestern Pennsylvania Heritage Preservation
Commission, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
May 10, 2000

Mr. MUurTHA introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on Resources

A BILL

To reauthorize the Southwestern Pennsylvania Heritage

Preservation Commission, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. COMMISSION EXTENDED TO TWENTY YEARS.

Section 104 of the Act entitled “An Act to establish
in the Department of the Interior the Southwestern Penn-
sylvania Heritage Preservation Commission, and for other

purposes’”, approved November 19, 1988 (Public Law

oo N oo o b~ W N BB

100-698) is amended—



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

e~ i < e
g A W N B O

2
(1) in the flush material at the end of sub-

section (a), by striking “10 years” and inserting “20
years’’; and
(2) in subsection (e), by striking “10 years”
and inserting ‘20 years”.
SEC. 2. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

Section 105 of the Act entitled “An Act to establish
in the Department of the Interior the Southwestern Penn-
sylvania Heritage Preservation Commission, and for other
purposes”, approved November 19, 1988 (Public Law
100-698) is amended by inserting ‘‘for each of fiscal years
2001 through 2010 after “$3,000,000”.

SEC. 3. EFFECTIVE DATE.
The amendment made by section 1 shall be deemed

to have taken effect on November 18, 1998.
O

*HR 4420 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T17:32:04-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




