AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

106TH CONGRESS
L9 H, R, 4956

To increase the amount of student loans that may be forgiven for service
as a teacher in a school with a high concentration of low-income students.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JuLy 25, 2000
§

Mr. PAYNE introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Kducation and the Workforce

A BILL

To increase the amount of student loans that may be for-
oiven for service as a teacher in a school with a high

concentration of low-income students.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Teacher Loan Forgive-
ness Act of 2000,

SEC. 2. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF STUDENT LOANS ELIGI-
BLE FOR FORGIVENESS FOR SERVICE AS A

TEACHER.

© 00 N O 0o b~ W N P

(a) GUARANTEED LOANS.—Section 428J(¢)(1) of the

10 IHigher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1078-10(c¢)(1))



o A~ W N B

2

is amended by striking “$5,000” and inserting

“$12.800".

(b) DIRECT LLOANS.—Section 460(¢)(1) of the Higher
Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1087j(¢)(1)) is amend-

ed by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$12,800".
O

*HR 4956 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T15:55:45-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




