AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

Calendar No. 632
S, 1367
[Report No. 106-314]

To amend the Act which established the Saint-Gaudens National Historic
Site, in the State of New Hampshire, by modifying the boundary and
for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JuLy 14, 1999
Mr. MURKOWSKI (by request) introduced the following bill; which was read
twice and referred to the Committee on Energy and Natural Resources
JUNE 27, 2000
Reported by Mr. MURKOWSKI, with an amendment

[Omit the part struck through and insert the part printed in italic]

A BILL

To amend the Act which established the Saint-Gaudens Na-
tional Historic Site, in the State of New Hampshire,

by modifying the boundary and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 tiwves of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
3 That the Aet of Anenst 31 1964 (8 Stat: M9 Public
4 Law 88-543 (16 U.S.C. 461 (note)), which established

5 Saint-Gaudens National Historie Site 1s amended—



o N oo o b~ W N B

2

(1) in section 3 by striking “not to exceed sixty-
four acres of lands and interests therein” and insert-
ing “215 acres of lands and buildings, or interests
therein’;

(2) in section 6 by striking “$2,677,000” from
the first sentence and inserting “$10,632,000”; and

(3) in section 6 by striking “$80,000” from the

last sentence and inserting “$2,000,000”.

S 1367 RS






Calendar No. 632

106TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 1 367

[Report No. 106-314]

A BILL

To amend the Act which established the Saint-
Gaudens National Iistoric Site, in the State of
New Hampshire, by modifying the boundary and
for other purposes.

JUNE 27, 2000

Reported with an amendment



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-16T16:44:46-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




