AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION
GPO

108TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION H R 1 O 4 8

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of assistance
for certain disabled veterans for specially adapted housing and automobile
and adaptive equipment.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

MarcH 4, 2003
Mr. BrRowN of South Carolina (for himself, Mr. RODRIGUEZ, Mr. SMITH of
New Jersey, and Mr. EVANS) introduced the following bill; which was re-
ferred to the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs

A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the
amount of assistance for certain disabled veterans for
specially adapted housing and automobile and adaptive
equipment.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘“Disabled Veterans

o A~ W N BB

Adaptive Benefits Improvement Act of 2003,



2
1 SEC. 2. INCREASE IN ASSISTANCE AMOUNT FOR SPECIALLY

2 ADAPTED HOUSING.

3 Section 2102 of title 38, United States Code, is
4 amended—

5 (1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1) of
6 subsection (a), by striking “$48,000” and inserting
7 “$50,000”’; and

8 (2) in subsection (b)(2), by striking “$9,250”
9 and inserting “$10,000”.

10 SEC. 3. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF ASSISTANCE FOR AUTO-

11 MOBILE AND ADAPTIVE EQUIPMENT FOR
12 CERTAIN DISABLED VETERANS.
13 Section 3902(a) of title 38, United States Code, is

14 amended by striking “$9,000” and inserting “$11,000".
O

*HR 1048 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-15T04:40:14-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




