AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

108TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 9 26

AN ACT

To amend section 5379 of title 5, United States Code, to
increase the annual and aggregate limits on student loan
repayments by Federal agencies.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Federal Employee Stu-

o A~ W N BB

dent Lioan Assistance Act’”.



2
1 SEC. 2. STUDENT LOAN REPAYMENTS.

2 Section 5379(b)(2) of title 5, United States Code, is

3 amended

4 (1) in subparagraph (A), by striking “$6,000”
5 and inserting “$10,000”; and

6 (2) in subparagraph (B), by striking “$40,000”
7 and inserting “$60,000”.

Passed the Senate July 30 (legislative day, July 21),
2003.

Attest:

Secretary.

TS 926 ES



108TH CONGRESS
1ST SESSION S. 926

AN ACT

To amend section 5379 of title 5, United States
Code, to inerease the annual and ageregate limits
on student loan repayments by Federal agencies.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-15T06:03:19-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




