AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

110TH CONGRESS
L9 H, R, 7169

To amend Public Law 106-392 to extend the authorizations for the Upper

M.

To

~N N O B W

Colorado and San Juan River Basin endangered fish recovery programs,
and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

SEPTEMBER 26, 2008
UpALL of New Mexico (for himself, Mr. UDALL of Colorado, Mr.
SALAZAR, Mr. MATHESON, Mrs. MUSGRAVE, Ms. DEGETTE, and Mrs.
WILSON of New Mexico) introduced the following bill; which was referred
to the Committee on Natural Resources

A BILL

amend Public Law 106-392 to extend the authorizations
for the Upper Colorado and San Juan River Basin en-
dangered fish recovery programs, and for other purposes.
Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. ENDANGERED FISH RECOVERY PROGRAMS.
(a) DEFINITIONS.—Section 2 of Public Law 106-392
(114 Stat. 1602) is amended—
(1) in paragraph (5), by inserting “‘, rehabilita-

tion, and repair” after “and replacement”; and



[E—

2
(2) in paragraph (6), by inserting “those for
protection of critical habitat, those for preventing
entrainment of fish in water diversions,” after
“instream flows,”.
(b) AUTHORIZATION ToO FUND RECOVERY PRro-
GRAMS.—Section 3 of Public Law 106-392 (114 Stat.
1603; 120 Stat. 290) is amended—

O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R S R N e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O N O B BN~ WD = ©

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking
“$61,000,000” and inserting “$88,000,000"’;

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “2010”
and inserting “2023”; and

(C) in paragraph (3), by striking “2010”
and inserting “2023";

(2) in subsection (b)—

(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by striking “$126,000,000” and inserting
“$209,000,0007;

(B) in paragraph (1)—

(1) by striking “$108,000,000” and
inserting “$179,000,000’; and

(i1) by striking “2010” and inserting
“2023"; and

(C) in paragraph (2)—

*HR 7169 IH



AN W B~ W

3
(1) by striking “$18,000,000” and in-
serting “$30,000,000”’; and
(ii) by striking “2010” and inserting
“20237; and
(3) in  subsection (¢)(4), by striking
“$31,000,000” and inserting “$87,000,000".
O

*HR 7169 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2008-12-13T05:58:59-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




